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helping celebrate the 10th anniversary of Llangattock Green Valleys CIC 

 

Leona and Penny were commissioned by Llangattock Green Valleys CIC (LGV) to 
create an artwork in response to the construction of the recently completed micro-
hydro scheme at Blaen Dyar above the Clydach Gorge.  This was the fifth scheme 
completed over LGV’s 10 years of harnessing the power of valley streams in order to 
produce green energy for the immediate localities and the National Grid. 
 
Recording sounds and images at Blaen Dyar began with the first spadefuls of earth 
being dug in February 2017, and followed the process through the positioning of the 
pipes, the construction of the turbine house, to the first full generation of electricity in 
October 2017. 
   
re:Source,  created from this raw material, takes the form of videomusic, an abstract 
genre in which sound and visuals work together but not in a straightforward manner 
(ie the images seen are not linked with their sounds by the act of recording, and vice 
versa). The goal is to create a flow of immersive visuals and sounds which moves 
through moods, and is open to imaginative interpretation by the audience.  

The vast majority of the sounds and images used in the work are original recordings 
made by Penny and Leona during the construction process.  Some have been left as 
captured, while others are highly digitally manipulated.  

Our world is dependent on electricity.  It’s all around us – powering technology within 
this room, sparking in the synapses of our nervous systems.  Electricity enabled 
re:Source to be made.  But the question ‘What exactly is electricity?’ is still to be fully 
answered. 

We’re also dependent on water.   We are 60% water.   71% of the earth’s surface is 
covered with it.  Rain falls on mountainsides, streams tumble and grow before flowing 
into the sea, and the cycle begins again.  Water ‘does nothing, absolutely nothing, but 
be itself’ (Nan Shephard, The Living Mountain, 1977).  But water is stronger than rock, 
and is increasingly a political element. 

re:Source invites a re-connection with the wonders of water and electricity, their 
powers and their beauties, and also acknowledges the human ingenuity essential for 
harnessing both to supply the green energy so needed. 

Leona Jones 








